TOWN OF MONTEREY
435 Main Rd. P.O. Box 308
Monterey, MA 01245

March 21, 2023

Town of Monterey

Board of Selectmen

Melissa Noe, Town Administrator
435 Main Road

Monterey, MA 01245

Re: Board of Health Endorsement to Pool Opioid Settlement Dollars to Rural Recovery Center
Dear Respected Members of the Board,

As you are aware the AG’s office has settled a large lawsuit apd all municipalities in the Commonwealth over the next
several years will be getting allocations of Opioid settlement money.

The Monterey Board of Health working in concert with the Southern Berkshire Public Health Collaborative have been
facilitating and identifying ways to maximize these settlement dollars that will directly impact those that have been affected
by Opioids and to determine if pooling these funds with other towns would provide the largest impact.

One organization that really provides comprehensive services and support to our residents in need is the Rural Recovery
Resources/South County Recovery Center which is housed in Great Barrington. They serve all the residents of South
County. Our residents are directly impacted by the services they deliver and by South County towns pooling their allocation
to the RRC, it could really make further impacts to our residents.

The Monterey Board of Health at its regularly scheduled meeting on March 20, 2023, has voted to support and send this
support letter to the Selectboard for their approval in hopes the town allocation could be given to Rural Recovery Resources.

Attached herein is a white paper highlighting the Rural Recovery Resources and other documents for your review. Staff from
the Rural Recovery Resources can be made available if the Selectboard has further questions or if you would like them to

attend a meeting on this topic. Thank you for your time and consideration on this matter.

Respectfully,

Al

James J. Wilusz, R.S.
Executive Director of Public Health/Registered Sanitarian

Cc: Board of Health, Rural Recovery, Ananda Timpane, Gary Pratt, Smitty Pignatelli

Phone: 413.528.1443 Fax: 413.528.9452
admin@montereyma.gov
WWW.montereyma.gov
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Rural Recovery Resources & South County Recovery Center
Massachusetts State-Subdivision for Statewide Opioid Settlement Funds Request

Statewide Opioid Settlement Funds now allocated to eligible municipalities for the years 2022-2038 include funds
for all 14 towns of southern Berkshire County. Rural Recovery Resources & South County Recovery Center
requests the Town to dedicate its opioid settlement funds — as detailed in the attached allotment per year
breakdown — to the Recovery Center to strengthen resources available to individuals and families in South
County for substance use disorder prevention, harm reduction, treatment, and recovery. Rural Recovery
Resources & Recovery Center launched in 2020 with 3-year funding from the Health Resources and Services
Administration’s Rural Communities Opioid Response Program. The Town'’s investment will:

e  Provide services support — including recovery coaching, post-overdose response, support groups, and
advocacy —to the over 1700 people with substance and opioid use disorders (SUD/OUD) in South County.

e Reduce deaths resulting from SUD/OUD and increase people who enter recovery and thrive.

e Fxpand access to harm reduction and overdose prevention strategies, including naloxone (Narcan) training,
distribution and community access points.

e Strengthen coping mechanisms among people with SUD/OUD for facing South County’s high risk factors,
increasing resiliency, and greatly reducing the likelihood of return to active drug use.

e  Support family and friends of SUD/OUD affected people with support groups, advocacy, and education.

e Bolster South County’s local workforce through training and collaboration with local agencies and increased
support for career skills development for people with SUD/OUD.

e Train professionals, healthcare workers, and first responders working in the best practices for screening,
referral, stigma reduction, and provide the most up-to-date assessment of community needs.

e Continue collaborations that have already brought that have already brought over $1.2 million into our region
by leveraging small local dollars by a factor of 20:1 by accessing federal, state, and foundation grant funding.

There is a Tremendous Need

Southern Berkshire County residents face many challenges as they navigate their substance use and recovery
needs.

e 1n 2021, more than 1700 South County residents presented to Berkshire Health Systems for health care had a
substance/opioid use disorder diagnosis, but few received referrals for support in South County.

e Since launching in 2021, Rural Recovery has served more 50/week with recovery coaching and recovery
support groups and over 300 people since opening the doors of the Recovery Center in April 2022.

e Overdose deaths continue to climb in Berkshire County — 62 in 2021 — with the continued impact of the
COVID-19 pandemic and spread of fentanyl adulterated substances. 10 people died from overdose in 2021.

e People living in the Berkshires are more likely to experience substance use than those in the rest of the
Commonwealth. Recovery focused supports address the whole picture each person is navigating.

e  Accessing treatment and support for recovery in South County has been difficult to impossible in the past.
South County Recovery Center is for everyone impacted: including people who use drugs, people in early and
long-term recovery, friends and family, and concerned citizens who just want to help.

There is a clear need to continue to secure our region’s capacity to provide positive SUD/OUD treatment and
recovery support.

67 State Road ® Great Barrington e MA e 01230 e 413.645.3564



Track Record of Success

We advance SUD/OUD prevention and support in South County, with:

e High quality programs led by trained staff and expert partners, including All-Recovery Meetings serving 40+
people weekly, recovery coaching, financial literacy and pathways to financial stability, events and volunteer
opportunities at the Recovery Center.

e Expanded opportunities for professional development for allied health professionals in Berkshire County: The
Foundations of Addictions Recovery, developed and presented by Berkshire Community College in
collaboration with Rural Recovery Resources; SUD/OUD Screening and Referral for Health Providers; and
Regular Community Naloxone (Narcan) Trainings.

e Convene the annual Smash the Stigma event, convening 100-200 people annually to share experiences with
SUD/OUD, recovery, and resources and to raise awareness about the impact of SUD/OUD and reduce stigma.

e Strategic collaborations to prevent/reduce substance use disorders and increase access to treatment and
recovery, including with: the Berkshire Opioid Addiction Prevention Collaborative; Brien Center, South County
co-responder; South Berkshire Community Health Coalition; Rural Health Network, South Berkshire Public
Health Collaborative; Fairview Hospital; Volunteers in Medicine; the CSO Family Resource Center, Great
Barrington Police Department; South Berkshire Ambulance Squad; Construct; and more.

e South County Recovery Center utilizes the RecoveryLink data collection platform to track Recovery Capital and
to provide robust data to public health officials and funders. Recovery Capital is a metric that measures
personal internal and external resources necessary for a person to achieve and sustain recovery.

Rural Recovery and South County Recovery Center — Partners and Sustainability

The mission of Rural Recovery Resources and South County Recovery Center is to lower the morbidity and
mortality associated with substance use and to foster a culture of compassion and empathy in our peer-driven
community. We are committed to engage, assist, refer, and empower people who are affected in any way by
addiction; to improve their health and wellness, live a self-directed life, and strive to reach their full potential, in a
judgment-free atmosphere.

By leveraging community partnerships, Rural Recovery Resources and South County Recovery Center was launched
in 2020 as part of a 3-year consortium grant from the Human Resources and Services Administration’s Rural
Communities Opioid Response program to increase prevention, treatment, and recovery access in South County.
The core consortium partners — Railroad Street Youth Project (fiscal agent), Brien Center, Fairview Hospital,
Berkshire Community College, Rural Health Network, and Southern Berkshire Public Health Collaborative — work in
tandem to change the landscape and make South County a place where people impacted with SUD/OUD can find
support, access treatment, find paths to recovery and thrive.

To make sure the resources created and launched since the project’s launch continue and expand, Rural Recovery
Resources and South County Recovery Center will incorporate as a stand-alone 501{c})(3) non-profit over the next
year. We are continuing collaboration with our partners to ensure the work we’ve already completed, such as
education, prevention, screening, referral, recovery coaching and operation of the Center will be sustained and
continue to assist those in South Berkshire County affected by SUD/OUD long into the future. Utilizing opioid
settlement funds are vital to securing this important, much needed, community resource and addressing the deep
impact of the opioid epidemic in South County. Securing the Recovery Center as a place and resource for the
people most impacted is the most direct route to meeting the mandated use for the funds: strengthening
resources available to communities and families for substance use disorder prevention, harm reduction,
treatment, and recovery for South County.

For more information contact: Gary Pratt, Director, Rural Recovery & South County Recovery Center,
gary@rural-recovery.org or 413-854-5828.

67 State Road e Great Barrington e MA e 01230 e 413.645.3564




Town of Monterey FAQ

Estimated Opioid Settlement Payments

Settled by the MA Attorney General's Office
as of 3/1/24

How much will the Town of Monterey receive with existing settlements?

There are currently 6 settlements that have been offered to the Town of Monterey through the MA Attorney General's
Office, each with their own time frame and allocation formula. These settlements will be dispersed through 2031. If
Monterey chooses to participate in all of them, the following represents payments recieved for this fiscal year (FY23),
anticipated payments in FY24 and the total amount anticipated over the next life of all the current settlements, based on
information on the State website known as of 3/3/21 on wvirv.inass. cov/lists/numnicipal-abatement-payvments

FY23 Funds: $ 1,863.19 Funds received as of 3/1/23 in FY23 that includes years 1-5 from J&J (paid 11/2/22)
and "Distribution Payments" (paid 7/15/22 and 9/30/22)

FY24 Total: $ 1,166.12 Walm-arl, Teva, Allergan, CVS, & Walgreens - if the Town signs settlement

(Approximate) agreement

Total through 2031:  § 9,385.22 Total anticipated funds for Town of Monterey over 19 years with participation in
(Approximate) settlements from J&J, Walmart, Teva, Allergan, CVS, & Walgreens

What can be done with the settlement funds?

Funds are limited to the care, treatment, and other programs and expenditures designed to

(1) address the misuse and abuse of opioid products,

(2) treat or mitigate opioid use or related disorders, or

(3) mitigate other alleged effects of, including on those injured as a result of, the opioid epidemic.

In the settlements' abatement terms, municipalities are encouraged to pool their resources to make maximum impact.
Settlement funds can also be directed towards agencies and organizations that support people impacted by opioid use
disorder. In Southern Berkshire County, many towns are making the decision to support the Rural Recovery Resources'
South County Recovery Center.

Rural Recovery Resources and South County Recovery Center was launched in 2020 as part of a 3-year consortium
grant from the HRSA to increase prevention, treatment, and recovery access in South County. Already, the Recovery
Center's work has had a direct positive impact on people who have been impacted by opioid use disorder making their
work eligible to recieve settlement funds.

How can the town appropriate funds?

Towns have already received the first 5 years of the settlement in FY23. Because these funds came directly to the towns
vs through a grant, those payments have been put into the general funds in FY23, meaning the Towns now need to
appropriate the funds to be used for their intended purposes. There are a few ways of doing this, per the MAHB opinion
document. The Massachusetts Health Association Board (MAHB) has issued an opinion on how this can be done, which
are also summarized on the back of this FAQ sheet. Your town accountant may have their own strategy to ensure that
these funds are used for their required purpose.

What are we asking the Selectboard to do?

We respectfully request that settlement funds received in FY23 be appropriated to support the South County
Recovery Center for substance use disorder prevention, harm reduction, treatment and recovery. More
information on Rural Recovery Resources can be found at www.rural-recovery.org




Town of Monterey FAQ

Estimated Opioid Settlement Payments

Settled by the MA Attorney General's Office
as of 3/1/24

What are options for appropriating opioid settlement funds received during FY23?

Option A: Appropriate Funds Directly at Town Meeting (upon
certification of free cash) - One option presented by MAHB

To see if the Town will vote to appropriate a sum of money from the FY23 General Fund Revenue [or whatever the

municipal’s general fund is called] when certified as free cash to be expended in accordance with the Massachuselts

State-Subdivision for Statewide opioid settlement funds; funds to be used to supplement and strengthen resources

available to communities and families for substance use disorder prevention, harm reduction, treatment, and recovery

or to take any other action relative therelo.

(Select Board)

MOTION MOVED AND SECONDED that the Town vote to appropriate § to be expended in accordance
with the Massachusetts State-Subdivision for Statewide opioid settlement fund, funds to be used to supplement and
strengthen resources available to communities and families for substance use disorder prevention, harm reduction,
treatment, and recovery, and that to meet this appropriation § be funded from the General Fund Revenue
[or whatever the municipal’s general fund is called] when certified as free cash by Miscellaneous Non-Recurring
General Fund Revenue.

Option B: Create and Fund an Opioid Stabilization Fund at Town Meeting

(This would secure the funds which could then be appropriated by 2/3 majority approval at a Town Meeting) -
One option suggested by MAHB

Step #1: Place Article to Create a Stabilization Fund on Town Meeting Warrant

To see if the Town will vote to create an Opioid Settlement Stabilization Fund in accordance with Massachuselts
General Laws, Section 5B of Chapter 40, and to appropriate a sum of money to such fund; determine whether this
appropriation shall be from fiee cash, other available funds or otherwise; and take any other action in relation thereto.

(Selectboard)
MOTION MOVED AND SECONDED that the Town create an Opioid Settlement Stabilization Fund in accordance

with Massachusetts General Laws, Chapter 40, Section 5B.
Step #2: Article to Fund Opioid Settlement Stabilization Fund

To see if the Town will vote to transfer from Free Cash, or other available funds, fo the Opioid Settlement
Stabilization Fund established at the 202_Town Meeting or take any other action in relation thereto.

(Selectboard)
MOTION MOVED AND SECONDED that the Town vote to appropriate § [Amount of Settlement Proceeds
Seeking to Appropriate] from Free Cash to the Opioid Settlement Stabilization Fund established at the ___ Town

Meeting.

Option C: Create a Line Item in FY24 Budget

Another strategy being adopted by some communities is to create line item in FY24 Budget named to make it clear it is
to be used for opioid mitigation include the dollar amount recieved in FY23 fiscal year in that line item.

These appropaches are provided for educational purposes only are not to be construed as legal advice. For legal advice, please
contact your town attorney. The approach for your town to secure these funds should be made by your town leadership and
accountant.




Southern Berkshire Towns Opioid Settlement Summary
Per State Website Municpal Abatement Payment Website 2/28/23 is

Distributor
APPROX TOTAL| Payment* J&) Walmart** Teva Allergan CVS *** Walgreens
TOWN FUNDS (1 Year) (19 Years) (6 Years) (12 Years) (7 Years) (10 Years) (15 Years)
Alford FY23 | S 329.40 | $ 11159 | S  217.81($ - |s - 1S - |$ £ S .
Fy2a | $ 206 $ 54008 6137 | $ 1891 | $ 2092 |$ 23253 2728
Total Funds thorugh 2031 $ 1,659 |$ 11159 |$ 293.00|$ 184.10(|$ 24577 |$ 14642 |$ 32509 ($ 353.51
Egremont FY23 |$  2,24406 |$ 76019 | S 148387 S - |8 - |8 B 5 $ -
Fy24 | $ 1,405 $ 37100|$ 41806 |$ 12879|$ 14250|$ 15838 |$  185.82
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 11,304 | $ 760.19 | $ 1,994.00 | $ 1,254.17 | $ 1,675.32 |$ 997.48 | $ 2,214.74 | $ 2,408.30
Gt Barrington | FY23 | $ 10,556.32 [ $ 3,576.00 | $ 6,980.32 | $ - s - |$ = |s - |s -
FY24 | $ 6,607 $ 1,745.00 | $ 1,96659 |$ 60586 S 67032 |$ 74505 |$ 87412
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 53,173 | $ 3,576.00 | $ 9,381.00 | $ 5,899.77 | $ 7,876.19 | $ 4,692.26 | $10,418.38 | $ 11,328.90
Lee FY23 |$  67,167.21 | $22,753.17 | $44,414.04 | $ = IS - |8 - IIs 5 -
FY24 | s 42,039 $11,104.00 | $12,512.92 | $ 3,854.94 | $ 4,265.10 | $ 4,740.58 | $ 5,561.90
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 338,326 | $22,753.17 | $59,691.00 | $37,538.77 | $50,114.28 | $29,855.70 | $ 66,289.59 | $ 72,082.99
Lenox FY23 [$ 71,166.40 | $24,107.91 | $47,058.49 | $ - ]S - |$ - |$ - s -
FY24 | s 44,542 $11,765.00 | $ 13,257.95 | $ 4,084.47 | $ 4,519.05|$ 5,022.83 | $ 5,892.94
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 358,469 | $24,107.91 | $63,245.00 | $39,773.84 | $53,098.09 | $31,633.32 | $ 70,236.50 | $ 76,374.83
Monterey | FY23 [$  1,863.19|$ 63116 (S 1,232.03($ - s - S - |s = | S -
FY24 | $  1,166.12 S 30800|$ 34710|$ 10693 |$ 11831 |$ 13150|S$ 154.28
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $  9,385.22 | $ 631.16 | $ 1,656.00 [ $ 1,041.31 | $ 1,390.15|$ 82819 |$ 1,838.85 | $ 1,999.56
Mount Fy23 | § 51.00 $ 51005 - S - IS - ]S - S -
Washington | FY24 | S 49 S 13.00 | $ 1438 | $ 443 (S 490 (S 545 (S 6.39
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 363 | $ - |$ 69.00|$ 4315|$ 57.60|$ 3432(|$ 7620 $ 8286
New FY23 [$  1,456.50 |$ 49342 |S  963.08 (S - |s - s - ]S o I s
Marlborough| Fy24 $912 $ 24100|$ 27135|% 83.60|$S 9249 (S 102.80|$ 12061
Total Funds thorugh 2031 $7,336 $ 49342 |$ 1,294.00 |$ 814.05|$ 1,086.76 | $ 647.44 |$ 1,437.54 | $ 1,563.17
Otis FY23 [ $  1,55950 | $ 52829 (S 1,031.21 (S - s - |8 - s - |8 =
Fy24 | s 976 $ 258.00|% 29053|$ 8951|S% 99.03|$ 110.07 |S 129.14
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 8054 |$ 52829 |$ 1,386.00($ 87159 |$ 1,163.57 | $ 693.20 | $ 1,538.13 | $ 1,873.64
Sandisfield | Fv23 | $ 606.00 $  606.00|S = s - s = 1S = |is :
FY24 | $ 573 $ 151.00|$ 17067 |5 5258 |S  58.18|$ 64.66 | S  75.86
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 4,304 | $ - |$ 81400($ 512.02|$ 683.55|$ 407.23|$ 904.18 (S 983.20
Sheffield FY23 | $  2,944.02|$ 99730 |5 1,946.72 | ¢ - s - s - |3 o -
FY24 1,656 $ 48700|$ 54846 |S$ 16897 |5 186.95 (S 2079 | $  243.78
Total Funds thorugh 2031 13,832 $ 2,616.00 | $ 1,64538 | $ 2,196.58 | $ 1,308.62 | $ 2,905.56 | $ 3,159.50
Stockbridge | FY23 |$  3,38151|$ 682.63 |5 269888 (5% = s : s - s =0 B E
Fy24 | § 2,555 $ 675.00|$ 76036|S5 23425|S% 259.17 |5 288.07|S 337.97
Total Funds thorugh 2031 | $ 19,356 $ 3,627.00 | $ 2,281.09 | $ 3,045.26 | $ 1,814.22 | $ 4,208.17 | $ 4,380.21
Tyringham Fy23 | $ 374.00 S 374001|$ - S - S - S - S -
Fy24 | $ 355 $  9400|$ 10547 |S$ 3249 |S 35.95 S 39.96 |$  46.88
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 2,660 | S - S 503.00(S$ 31641|S 42241 (S 25165|S 558.76|S$ 607.57
W Stockbridge| FY23 |$  1,255.86 |$ 42543 |S 83043 (S . ||'s - S - ]S - ]S -
Fy24 |$ 786 S 20800 23396|$ 72.08|S%  79.75($ 8364 |$ 103.99
Total Funds thorugh 2031| $ 6,326 |$ 42543 |$ 1,116.00 |$ 70187 |$ 937.00|$ 55822 |$ 1,239.44 [ $ 1,347.76
* Unclear what "Distributor Payment” Is. Was found on Massachusetts Murnicipal Oplold Abatement Payments as of Nov 4, 2022, No information for MTW, SND or TYR.

** Walgreens column doesn't have annual amount. State website says most payments will be distributed the first three years so amount is total divided by 3

***% Unclear if CVS Payment will be cut in FY23 or FY24. Website says 6/30/23




BERKSHIRE COMMUNITIES [NGRID]
ALL-REQUIREMENTS RETAIL POWER SUPPLY PRICING MATRIX
COMBINED RATE COMPARISON

PROJECTED

FIXED PRICE BASIC SERVICE

11/1/23-4/30/24
START TERM END TERM TERM LENGTH SUPPLIER #1 SUPPLIER #2 NGRID/WCMA
STANDARD RETAIL ELECTRIC SUPPLY - Meets MA Requirement [59% for 2023; steps up each year] 0.19000

11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.17973 0.18708
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.17973 0.18708
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.11393 0.11504
11/1/2023 10/31/2024 12 0.14554 0.15383
11/1/2023 4/30/2025 18 0.15454 0.16063
11/1/2023 10/31/2025 24 0.14097 0.14829
11/1/2023 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 0.15183
11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 | No Bid 0.14554

RETAIL SUPPLY THROUGH PURCHASE OF NATIONAL WIND RECS - MA Requirement + 41% [59% + 41% VREC = 100% for 2023]

11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.18188 0.18849 :
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.18188 0.18849
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.11622 0.11659
11/1/2023 10/31/2024 12 0.14776 0.15530
11/1/2023 4/30/2025 18 0.15681 0.16219
11/1/2023 10/31/2025 24 0.14142 0.14990 .
11/1/2023 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 0.15348
11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 No Bid 0.14722

RETAIL SUPPLY THROUGH PURCHASE OF MA CLASS | RECS - MA Requirement + 5% [22% + 5% VREC = 27% for 2023]

13/1/2023  :©  4/30/2024 6 0.18190 0.18902
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.18190 0.18902
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.11610 0.11697
11/1/2023 10/31/2024 12 0.14771 0.15577
11/1/2023 4/30/2025 18 0.15668 0.16255
11/1/2023 10/31/2025 24 0.14309 0.15020
11/1/2023 + 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 015371
11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 No Bid 0.14740

RETAIL SUPPLY THROUGH PURCHASE OF MA CLASS | RECS - MA Requirement + 10% [22% + 10% VREC = 32% for 2023}

11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.18399 0.19096
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.18399 0.19096
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.11819 0.11890
11/1/2023 : 10/31/2024 12 0.14980 0.15770 :
11/1/2023 ; 4/30/2025 18 0.15874 0.16447
11/1/2023 : 10/31/2025 24 0.14514 0.15211
11/1/2023 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 0.15559

11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 No Bid 0.14926



BERKSHIRE COMMUNITIES [NGRID]
ALL-REQUIREMENTS RETAIL POWER SUPPLY PRICING MATRIX
COMBINED RATE COMPARISON

PROJECTED

FIXED PRICE BASIC SERVICE

11/1/23-4/30/24

START TERM END TERM TERM LENGTH SUPPLIER #1 SUPPLIER ¥2 NGRID/WCMA
RETAIL SUPPLY THROUGH PURCHASE OF MA CLASS | RECS - MA Requirement + 25% [22% + 25% VREC = 47% for 2023]
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.19026 0.19679
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.19026 0.19679
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.12446 0.12468
11/1/2023 10/31/2024 12 0.15607 0.16351
11/1/2023 4/30/2025 18 0.16493 0.17023
11/1/2023 10/31/2025 24 0.15127 0.15784 :
11/1/2023 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 0.16124
11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 No Bid 0.15483

RETAIL SUPPLY THROUGH PURCHASE OF MA CLASS | RECS - MA Requirement + 50% [22% + 50% VREC = 72% for 2023]

11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.20072 0.20650
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.20072 0.20650
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.13492 0.13432
11/1/2023 10/31/2024 12 0.16653 0.17319
11/1/2023 4/30/2025 18 0.17525 0.17983
11/1/2023 10/31/2025 24 0.16150 0.16740
11/1/2023 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 0.17064
11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 No Bid 0.16412

RETAIL SUPPLY THROUGH PURCHASE OF 100% MA CLASS | RECS [RPS MA Class | Minimum Standard] + [MA Class | VRECs] = 100%

11/1/2023 4/30/2024 . 6 0.21180 0.21682
11/1/2023 4/30/2024 6 0.21180 0.21682
5/1/2024 10/31/2024 6 0.14578 0.14435
11/1/2023 10/31/2024 12 0.17751 0.18337 :
11/1/2023 4/30/2025 18 0.18573 0.18963
11/1/2023 10/31/2025 24 0.17170 0.17692
11/1/2023 4/30/2026 30 No Bid 0.17973

11/1/2023 10/31/2026 36 No Bid 0.17281



TOWN OF MONTEREY

EARTH REMOVAL PERMIT
Permit No. Date Expiration Date
Date Paid, Amt_3/79/73 $50 ~ Select Board Hearing Date
(fee: 350) Is Site Plan attached? ! Yes ! No
Applicant__Tvinn  (onSinucdion | tigh Tryac
Address Y/ Mcz,n ?201(:{ M ﬂnﬁax_/ Irip o‘;?ﬂiff
Phone 43 -52% - 4900
Site Location livuld Zoad | Montferts

Amount of earth to be removed (in cubic feet) IS U0 _cdbic w{s

Method of earth removal J»Luwu uM,g e it “Jcks

Means of drainage control ngrcu,l &) f,gﬁf’-w @r_mmfﬂt/

Disposition of Waste Material MIa

Name of Licensed Hauler License No.

Address Phone

The Debris will be disposed of in: A /ﬁ

(Location of Facility)

No. of feet from traveled ways and property lines (include site plans)

Mgt gve— Date 5/ 19 / 23 Date
Applicant’s Signature Hauler’s Signature
DETERMINATION OF SELECT BOARD AND CONDITIONS Dated
Determination: ! Favorable ! Unfavorable (within 30 days of application)
Conditions:
Select Board, Chair Select Board Member Select Board Member

cc: Building Inspector, Town Clerk, Board of Health



